
Frost the Trail run raises funds for 3 homes
KUALALUMPUR A total of14
companies 25 teams and 100
runners gathered at the Ke
pong Botanical Garden KBG
area of the Forest Reserve In
stitute Malaysia FRIM re
cently for the flag off of the in
augural Frost Sullivan Frost
the Trail run for corporate so
cial responsibility CSR
Successfully held in Singa

pore for four years now Frost
the Trail KL Corporate Chal
lenge is set to be an annual
event here inMalaysia
FRIM was specially selected

as the location for the first run
that was aimed at raising
funds for three charities as
well as instilling an appreci
ation for greeningthe environ
ment and contributing to a
sustainable world through
both ecological and human
sustainability practices
Frost the Trail KL Corporate

Challenge saw teams of four
runners each having to com
plete 8 1km which started
around the scenic lake route of
KBG Mowed by a track
through the jungle and a
sprint over a rugged track
In line with the objective of

promoting teamwork the
winners were tabulated based
on the time each team man
aged to complete the circuit
The three beneficiaries of

this charity run were Pusat
Kasih Sayang YWCA Pusat
Jagaan Kanak Kanak Kurang
Upaya KIRTASH and Yayasan
AnakWarisanAlam YAWA

The children of Pusat Kasih
Sayang YWCA and KIRTASH
danced for the crowd while
YAWA put on a riveting eco
drum performance which
saw the children playing mu
sical instruments made from
recycled and usedmaterials
Frost Sullivan Asia Pacific

partner and managing direct
or Manoj Menon said they
were pleased with the re
sponse to the inaugural event
here

Through the annual Frost
the Trail KL Corporate Chal
lenge we hope to enhance
awareness about the import
ance of creating sustainable
value and corporate sustain
ability

The run is also a great op

portunity for employees to get
together and have fun among
their peers as well as mem
bers of the community from
other companies in a common
worthycause

It is very heartening to re
ceive participation from other
companies who are like
minded in the objectives of in
corporating CSR and corpor
ate environmentalism into
their business activities

Through their generous
donations we were able to
make a difference for the chil
dren in these three organisa
tions Menon said
The guest of honour at the

event was FRIM director gen
eral Datuk Dr Abd Latif
Mohmod Others present in

cluded Frost Sullivan chair
man David Frigstad and glob
al president and managing
partnerAroop Zutshi
The winning team for the

run was Accenture Team 1
made up of runners Ben
Zuehlsforf Chua Swee Hock
Jennifer Ng and Lun Keat
Seong
Zuehlsforf and Ngwere also

the fastest male and female
runner respectively
The first runner up was

Digi Team 1 with team mem
bers Christian Schutt Jarand
Fjeld Per Brogaard and Per
Christian Mortand while the
second runner up went to Ac
centure Team 2 comprising
Chee Hon Siew Freddy Loo
Fung Kit Lim and Teh SuAnn
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